Culvert Pipe
HWAY 13-15 Tally Sheet — March 29, 2013

BIDDERS | Lane Enterprises | Chemung Supply
ROUND GALVANIZED PIPE
Diameter Corrugation Gage Price Price / Grand Price Price / Grand
Per Foot Collar Total Per Foot Collar Total
LOT A
10” 2 213”7 x 2" 16 7.82 7.82 6.47 6.47 12.94
12” 2 213”7 x 2" 16 8.16 8.16 7.18 7.18 14.36
15” 2 2/3” x 1. 16 10.26 10.26 9.44 9.44 18.88
18” 2 213”7 x 2" 16 12.39 12.39 11.24 11.24 22.48
24” 2 2/3” x 1. 16 16.69 16.69 15.34 15.34 30.68
30” 2 213”7 x 2" 14 25.06 25.06 22.99 22.99 45,98
36” 2 2/3” x 2" 14 30.68 46.02 28.11 28.11 56.22
TOTALS: Lot A 111.06 126.40 100.77 100.77 201.54
LOTB
42” 223" x Yo" 12 47,55 71.33 42.78 42.78 85.56
48” 2 213”7 x 2" 12 53.69 80.54 48.84 48.84 97.68
54” 2 2/3” x 1. 12 64.19 96.29 58.20 58.20 116.40
60”* 223" x Yo" 10 86.34 129.51 78.94 118.41 197.35
727* 2 213”7 x 2" 10 96.87 193.74 101.24 151.86 253.10
847* 5”"x1” 14 97.48 194.96 88.24 176.48 264.72
96”* 57 x1” 14 108.75 217.50 99.44 298.32 397.76
TOTALS: LotB 554.87 983.87 517.68 894.89 | 1,412.57

* Collars are two feet (2’) wide for these pipes

GALVANIZED PIPE ARCH CULVERTS

LOTC

Diameter | Rise Cor_ru- Gage Price Price / Grand Price Price / Grand

gation Per Foot Collar Total Per Foot Collar Total
6’9" 4’11” | 5" x1” 12 113.25 226.50 103.72 207.44 311.16
7’11” 57" |5”"x1” 12 130.45 260.90 119.44 238.88 358.32
9’4" 6’3" |5"x1” 12 192.63 385.26 176.33 352.66 528.99
10°8” 6’11” | 57 x 1” 10 242.40 484.80 226.72 680.16 906.88
11°10” 77 |57 x1” 10 263.19 526.38 238.40 715.20 953.60
12°10” 8’4" |5”"x1” 10 no bid no bid 45880 | 1,376.40 | 1,835.20
14°3” 8’11” |5”"x 1" 10 no bid no bid 552.20 | 1,656.60 | 2,208.80
TOTALS: LotC 941.92 941.92 1,875.61 | 5,227.34| 7,102.95

ROUND POLYETHYLENE PIPE
(ADS-N-12, Prolink Ultra or Equal)

LOTD
Smoother | Price Per Smoother | Price Per
Diameter Inte_rior Each Grand Inte_rior Each Grand
Price Extra Total Price Extra Total
Per Foot Collar Per Foot Collar
12” 4.40 6.60 4.48 5.30 9.78
15” 5.72 8.58 5.83 6.90 12.73
18” 8.50 12.75 8.65 10.20 18.85
24” 13.24 19.86 13.50 15.90 29.40
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30” 20.40 30.60 20.78 39.20 59.98
36" 26.10 39.15 26.62 50.00 76.62
TOTALS: LotD 78.36 117.54 79.86 127.50 207.36
LOTE
Smoother | Price Per Smoother | Price Per
Diameter Intgrior Each Grand Intgrior Each Grand
Price Extra Total Price Extra Total
Per Foot Collar Per Foot Collar
48” 44.45 88.90 45.45 45.45 90.90
60” no bid no bid 91.20 91.20 182.40
TOTALS: LotE 44.45 88.90 136.65 136.65 273.30
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SUBJECT TO FINAL APPROVAL




